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Subject: Re:10.19.13
From: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com>
Date: Mon, Dec 09,2013 1:44 pm
To: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
Attach: leftletterhead
bottom.letterhead

Hi Bill,
| sincerely apologize for the delay in the message. | wanted to thank you, Ryan, and Angie so much for the service at our ceremony and
| reception in October. They were awesome to work with and everyone had a great time. | feel very lucky to have met you at softball and gotten
| to see your business in action. Both Meghan and | will be referring you any chance we come upon.

I will be sending a thank you tip to your home address made outto you. Please pass along the appropriate amounts to Ryan and Angie.

Hope you holidays are well!

-Justin

| From: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
| To: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com>

| Sent: Thursday, September 5, 2013 11:00 AM

| Subject: RE: 10.19.13
| [Bovble Fialioum D1 Servise)

Yes, that is correct. Thanks Justin. Bill

-------- Original Message --------Subject: Re: 10.19.13From: Justin <dx1731@yvahoo.com >Date: Thu, September 05, 2013
7:53 amTo: Double Platinum D] Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com >
Sounds good. I understand cash money. Balance owed is 700, correct?- Justin
On Sep 4, 2013, at 2:39 PM, "Double Platinum DJ Service" <info@doubleplatinumdj.com> wrote:
<left letterhead> Awesome. It's 5010 S. Desoto Ct., New Berlin.
Bill
P.S. Just so there is no confusion, Justin, you do not mind paying in cash, right? Sometimes the occasional cash events we do the
customer mistakes cash fora check. How?? hahaha Just want to make sure. [ will write up a paid in full receipt as well.

-------- Original Message --------Subject: Re: 10.19.13From: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com>Date:
Wed, September 04, 2013 1:39 pmTo: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
Yep. that works for me. Shoot me your address and we will be there.

From: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
| To: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com>

| Sent: Wednesday, September 4, 2013 12:01 PM

Subject: RE: 10.19.13

<left.letterhead>

Can you do a 6pm on Thursday the 12th at my place? Bill

———————— Original Message -------- Subject: Re: 10.19.13 From: Justin
<dx1731@yahoo.com> Date: Wed, September 04, 2013 10:52 am To:
Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>

Hi Bill,

We are free evenings next week any day except Tuesday. We live near
Southridge if you want to meet near there, or I believe you are in New Berlin. We

1 can meet you somewhere out there. How about 6 pm on Monday or Wednesday?

-Justin

|

|

| From: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
| To: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com>

| Sent: Wednesday, September 4, 2013 10:37 AM

| Subject: RE: 10.19.13

<left.|letterhead> Hey Justin,

How are you?

Yeah, we will neeed the completed song book about a month prior. lets set up
a day to meet, so we can go through all the details and get the cash balance
squared away.

How does your week look next week? Bill

———————— Original Message -------- Subject: Re:
10.19.13 From: Justin <dx1731@yahoo.com> Date:
Wed, September 04, 2013 9:00 am To: Double
Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>
Hi Bill,

We are approaching the big date quickly. What are the
next steps with you and your team? Do we need to get
| together on song choices for the ceremony and
reception? Do I owe you some funds prior to the date?

-Justin
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